FW: FDOT Traffic Signal Maintenance & Compensation Anended
Agreement

Peggy Snyder <psnyder@nassauclerk.com>

Thu 8/15/2019.8:53 AM

Archive
To:Robert Companion <rcompanion@nassaucountyfl.com>; Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>;

CcSabrina Robertson <srobertson@nassaucountyfl.com>; Grayson Hagins <ghagins@nassaucountyfl.com>; Amber Carter
<acarter@nassaucountyfl.com>; Brenda Linville <blinville@nassauclerk.com>;

@ 1 attachments (74 KB)

Amendment Cover Page - Nassau County.pdf;

CONTAINS EXTERNAL SENDER CONTENT: Do not open attachments unless you are expecting them and

trust the sender.
- Technical Services

Robert,

I received this email this morning from Trey Butler with FDOT. |seems that the wrong Cover Page was signed
by the BOCC Chairman at the 8-12-19 BOICC meeting, This will have to go back to the Board to have the correct
Cover Page (attached) signed. Please advise when this will go back to the Board for signature.

Thanks,

Peggy

Peggy B. Snyder

Clerk Services/BOCC
Nassau County, Florida
904-548-4660
904-548-4669 (fax)
psnhyder@nassauclerk.com

From: Butler, Trey [mailto: Trey.Butler@dot.state.fl.us]

Sent: Thursday, August 15, 2019 8:40 AM

To: Peggy Snyder

Subject: Re: FDOT Traffic Signal Maintenance & Compensation Anended Agreement



Peggy,

Thank you. There is just one issue. The front page is an incorrect page that was mistakenly sent out.
The cover page should have been the attached document. | sent out the corrected cover page shortly
after the original was sent but this obviously caused some confusion with the documents. Please have
the attached copy signed.

The old cover page incorrectly refers to an "Attachment 1". The updated (attached) cover page refers
to the correct "Exhibit A". The reimbursement amount has not changed.

I'm sorry for any inconvenience. If you have any questions please let me know.

Thank you,

Thank you,

TREY BUTLER
ITS/Traffic Engineer Intern

11760 Marco Beach Drive, Suite 1
Jacksonville, FL 32224

Office: (904) 260-1567

Cell: (904) 463-9691
trey.butler@dot state fl.us

www.metriceng.com

From: Peggy Snyder <psnyder@nassauclerk.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2019 3:50 PM

To: Butler, Trey <Trey.Butler@dot.state.fl.us>

Cc: Companion, Robert <rcompanion@nassaucountyfl.com>; Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: FDOT Traffic Signal Maintenance & Compensation Anended Agreement

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution with links and attachments.

During a regular session of the Nassau County Board of County
Commissioners held August 12, 2019, the Board approved and authorized
the Chair to sign the referenced contract. Also attached are
certified copies of Resolution 2019-128 regarding same.



STATE OF FL.ORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

AMENDMENT TO THE TRAFFIC SIGNAL MAINTENANCE
AND COMPENSATION AGREEMENT

CONTRACT NO. _ARV54

FINANCIAL PROJECT NO. 41353218810

F.E.LD. NO. F591863042043

AMENDMENT NO.

THIS AMENDMENT TO THE TRAFFIC SIGNAL AND MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT (“Amendment”) is made

and entered into on this day of . by and between the STATE OF FLORIDA,

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION (‘Department’), an agency of the State of Florida, and Nassau_County,
("Maintaining Agency”).

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the Department and the Maintaining Agency on entered into a Traffic Signal
Maintenance and Compensation Agreement (“Agreement”’).

WHEREAS, the Parties have agreed to modify the Agreement on the terms and conditions set forth herein.

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants in this Amendment, the Agreement is amended as
follows:

1. Exhibit A is amended, superseded and replaced in its entirety with the new Exhibit A that is attached to this
Amendment.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned parties have executed this Amendment on the day, month and year set forth
above.

, Florida STATE OF FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
(Maintaining Agency)
By: By:
(Authorized Signature) (Authorized Signature)
Print/Type Name: Print/Type Name:
Title: Title:

Legal Review:




