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1. The Applicant must file this Economic Development Grant Application Form each year during the Applicant’s period of eligibility.
All Nassau County ad valorem taxes for the grant year must be paid before applying for the Economic Development Grant.
2. The application form must be filed with the NCEDB by mail or electronically:
Nassau County Economic Development Board
76346 William Burgess Boulevard
Yulee, FL 32097
e-mail: admin@NassauFlorida.com
3. The NCEDB will confirm with the Nassau County Tax Collector that taxes have been paid, and will verify that the applicable jobs
have been created and investments have been made during the year for which the award is being requested.
4. The NCEDB will recommend to the Nassau County Board of Commissioners the dollar amount of the grant to be awarded.
5. The Nassau County Board of Commissioners may accept NCEDB’s recommendation or adjust the dollar amount to be awarded at

its sole discretion.




Shelley Hirsch —

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Shelley,

Shanna Mallicoat <MallicoatS@vystarcu.org>
Thursday, July 13, 2017 11:41 AM

Shelley Hirsch

Laura DiBella

FW: VyStar CU 2nd Year EDG, Callahan Branch

| have received confirmation that for the 2016 year, the Callahan branch was staffed with 9 FT employees and

1 PT employee.

Does this accommodate what you’re looking for?

Please let me know if you have any questions or need any additional information.

Thank you,

Shanna Mallicoat
Purchasing Manager
VyStar Credit Union
904-594-5393

mallicoats@vystarcu.org

From: Shelley Hirsch [mail

:shelle

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 11:37 AM

To: Shanna Mallicoat
Cc: Laura DiBella

Subject: RE: VyStar CU 2nd Year EDG, Callahan Branch

Hello Shanna,

I am circling back on the below. Any updated paperwork on what [ sent/requested, per the Board of County

Commission personnel?

SHELLEY HIRSCH | OPERATIONS AND COMPLIANCE MANAGER

OFFICE: 904.225.8878

NASSAU COUNTY ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT BOARD

Email: Shelley@NassauFlorida.com

Website: www.nassauflorida.com




