NC17-018 Cold Plant Mix
Bid Tabulation
Bids Opened August 23, 2017

Duval Asphalt Products, inc.

Item Description Price per Ton
1 |Price per Ton at Plant Site $115.00
2 |Price per Ton F.O.B. Hilliard Florida $123.00
3 |Price per Ton F.0.B. Fernandina Beach Florida $122.00

Only one bid received
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY
1 TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS & ACCESSORIES
(a)|"U" Channel Post - Galvanized
(1)|8'x2 Ibs per foot No Bid No Bid $13.36 $11.95 $12.37
(2)]10'x2 Ibs per foot No Bid No Bid $16.70 $17.80 $15.39
(3)|12'x2 Ibs per foot No Bid No Bid $20.04 $21.25 $18.46
(4)|14'x2 Ibs per foot No Bid No Bid $23.80 $22.50 $21.54
(b)|Square Post (14 Gauge)
1 3/4"x1 3/4"x10 Feet $17.62 No Bid $17.70 $22.14 $18.56
2"x2"x12 Feet $22.42 No Bid $24.65 $28.09 $25.01
2"x2"x14 Feet $25.85 No Bid $28.76 $32.56 $29.18
(c)|Two Piece Breakaway - Square Anchors (12 Gauge)
2"%2"x36 inches $7.80 No Bid $8.24 $11.26 $8.58
2 1/4"x2 1/4"x36 inches $8.41 No Bid $8.82 $12.89 $9.59
(d)|Two Piece Breakaway - Square Sleeve (12 Gauge)
2 1/4"x2 1/4"x18 inches $4.53 No Bid $4.41 $6.90 $5.60
2 1/2"x2 1/2"x18 inches $4.90 No Bid $4.88 $7.33 $5.73
(e)|Omni Directional - Square Anchors (12 Gauge)
2"%2"x36 inches $19.68 No Bid $48.54 $23.96 No Bid
2 1/4"x2 1/4"x36 inches $20.41 No Bid $52.28 $24.96 No Bid

Recommendation:
Items: b, ¢, d, and e to Allied Tube & Conduit Corp.
Iltems: a Universal Signs & Accessories



NC17-021 Fuels

Bid Tabulation

Bids Opened August 23, 2017

Gate Fuel James River RKA Petroleum |Mansfield Oil
Service Inc  |Solutions Companies, Inc. |Company**
Item Description Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon
1 |[Gasoline 3 0.1197 | $ 0.0900 0.1158| $ 0.1555
2 |Diesel Fuel $ 0.1197 | $ 0.0900 0.1158] $ 0.1555

Apparent Low Bidder




NC17-024 TRAFFIC SIGN MATERIALS
BID TABULATION
BIDS OPENED August 23,2017

Vulcan Inc.,

Mandel Metals |Traffic dba Vulcan Osburn

Inc, dba Us Supplies and |Aluminum, dba |Associates

Standard Sign |Distribution |Vulcan Signs [Inc

Item Description Price Price Price Price
Horizontal Rectangle

1 12”7 x 6” x .063 g 1.411(S 1.60|S 1.11 S 0.80
2 12” x 9” x .080 5 2.31|9S 275 (S 157 | S 1.46
3 18” x 6” x .080 S 2311 210 $ 1.67 | S 1.46
4 18” x 15” x .063 S 8.86 S 350 (S 310 S 2.98
5 21”7 x 9” x .063 S 6.18 | S 3.00 S 234 (S 2.09
6 21” x 15” x .063 S 4.55|$ 5.86 | $ 3.80|S 3.47
7 24”x 9”7 x.063 S 2901 S 4.02 S 265(S 2.39
8 24” x 8” x .080 $ 343|S 3.57 | $ 2.85 (S 2.60
9 24” x 10” x .080 S 44115 4.46 | S 353 (S 3.25
10 24” x 12” x .080 S 43715 536 |S 42315S 3.90
11 24” x 18” x .080 S 6.57 | S 8.04 (S 6.21 ]S 5.85
12 30”x12” x .080 S 547 S 6.55 | S 542 |S 4.88
13 307 x18” x .080 S 821158 10.00 | S 805|S 731
14  |30” x 24” x .080 S 1096 | $ 13.42 | $ 1037 | S 9.75
15 36” x 8” x.080 5 450 | S 540 |S 435|S . 3.90
16 [36” x 12” x .080 5 6.57 | $ 7.90 | $ 6.42 | $ 5.85
17 36” x 20” x .080 S 14.37 (S 1342 | S 10.57 | S 9.75
18 36” x 24” x .080 S 13.13 ]S 15.98 | $ 1234 |S 11.70
19 42” x 30” x .100 5 2896 | S 28.00 | S 2078 S  17.06
20 48” x 18” x .080 S 13.13 (S 16.00 | S 1265(S 11.70
21  |48” x24” x .080 S 17.52|$ 2140 | $ 16.75|S  15.60
22 48” x 30” x .100 S 27.38| S 28.10 | S 26.01|S 25.10
23 48” x 36” x .100 S 32.85|S 3410 | S 31.20(S  30.12
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Vulcan Inc.,
Mandel Metals |Traffic dba Vulcan Osburn
Inc, dba Us Supplies and |Aluminum, dba [Associates
Standard Sign |Distribution [Vulcan Signs |Inc
Item Description Price Price Price Price
24 60” x 24” x .100 S 2738 S 28.00 | S 25.98 [EE RIS
25 60” x 30” x.100 S 342218 33.98 (S 31.09 | S 31.38
26 60” x 36” x.100 S 41.06 | S 45.00 | S 39.27 [ S 37.65
27 60” x 48” x .100 S 5476 | S 62.00 | S 51.95 (S 50.20
Street Name Signs
28 24” x 6” x .080 5 2695 280 | S 219 (S 1.95
29 30” x 6” x .080 S 3.08|S 333 |5 264 | S 2.44
30 ]36” x6” x.080 & 346 | S 4018 332 |$ 2.93
31 42” x 6” x .080 5 410 S 452 |S 393|S 3.41
32 24" x8”x.080 S 3.28 | S 3.70 | $ 2.85|5S 2.60
33 [30”x8”x.080 $ 3.83 (S 4.42 |$ 368|S 325
34 36” x 8” x .080 S 450 | S 540 (S 435S 3.90
35 42” x 8” x .080 S 540 (S 6.15| S 513 S 4.55
36 48” x 8” x .080 S 584 15S 7.00 | S 570 | S 5.20
37 30” x9” x .080 S 412 | S 5.00 | $ 3.88 S 3.66
36” x 9” x .080 — Specifications: 1 1/2" Radius
38 corners 2 3/8” holes centered 1 top & 1 bottom in
1” & 2 13/64” holes on each end in 1/2" $ 5959 6.28 | $ 488 |$ 4.39
42” x 9” x .080 — Specifications: 1 1/2" Radius
39 corners 2 3/8” holes centered 1 top & 1 bottom in
1” & 2 13/64” holes on each end in 1/2". S 7.531$ 7.00 | S 564 | S 5.11
40 48” x 9” x .080 $ 6.57 | S 8.00 | S 6.40 | S 5.85
41 60” x 18” x .125 S 26.46 | S 24.00 | S 2471 | S 23.10
42 |72” x18” x .125 $ 34.09|$ 30.00 | $ 29.62 | S 27.72
Vertical Rectangle
43 5%” x 15”x .063 with 1/8“ Radius Rounded
Corners $ 5.19 | $ 1.60 | $ 1.40|$ 091
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Vulcan Inc.,
Mandel Metals | Traffic dba Vulcan Osburn
Inc, dba Us Supplies and [Aluminum, dba [Associates
Standard Sign |Distribution |Vulcan Signs |Inc
Item Description Price Price Price Price
44  16” x 12” x .063 $ 1.41|$ 1.40 | $ 1.11|$S  0.80
45 197 x12”x.080 5 2.14 | $ 2.00|$ 1.65 | S 1.46
46 12” x 18” x .063 5 290 (S 3.80 | $ 226 | S 2.39
47 12” x 18” x .080 5 346 |$ 4.00 | S 3.10 | S 2.93
48 12”7 x 36” x .080 $ 6.57 | S 8.00 |$ 6.42 | S 5.85
49  |18” x24” x .080 S 6.57 | $ 8.00 | $ 6.21|$ 5.85
50 24” x 30” x .080 S 10.96 | S 1346 | S 1037 | S 9.75
51  ]30” x36” x.080 $ 16.42 | $ 20.00 | $ 15.61 | S  14.63
Square
52 18” x 18” x .063 $ 4.08 | S 6.01 ]S 386 |S 3.58
53 24” x 24” x .080 S 876 |S 11.00 | S 830 (S 7.80
54  130” x30” x .080 $ 13.68 | $ 16.75 | $ 1299 [$ 1219
55 36” x36” x .100 $ 2436 (S 38.00 | S 2355 |S  22.59
56  |48” x 48” x .100 $ 43.81$ 46.00 | $ 4156 | S  40.16
Diamond
57 18” x 18” x .080 S 492§ 6.00 | $ 473 1S 4.39
58 24” x 24” x .080 S 8.76 | S 10.68 | $ 838 |S 7.80
59 30” x 30” x .080 S 13.68| S 16.90 | $ 1299 (S 12.19
60 36” x 36” x .100 5 2436 (S 38.00 | S 23.52 FSRN22N59
61 |48” x48”x.100 S 43.81|$ 46.00 | $ 4156 | S  40.16
Octagon
62 18” x 18” x .080 with high intensity prismatic
STOP (finished sign) STD Holes $ - IS 10.00 | $ 8.65 | $ 7.21
63 30” x 30” x .080 with high intensity prismatic
STOP (finished sign) STD Holes S - S 28.00 | S 21.80 | S  20.04
64 36”x 36” x .100 with high intensity prismatic
STOP (finished sign) STD Holes $ - S 48.00 | S 36.95|S 37.10
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Vulcan Inc.,
Mandel Metals | Traffic dba Vulcan Osburn
Inc, dba Us Supplies and |Aluminum, dba |Associates
Standard Sign |Distribution ([Vulcan Signs |Inc
Item l Description Price Price Price Price
Triangle
65 [36” x36” x 36”.100 $ 9.76 | $ 35.00 | $ 1051 S 11.30
Circle
66 [12” x.080 5 2911($ 5.00($ 337 (S 1.95
67 15” x .080 S 5901 S 9.50 | S 4.201S 3.05
68 [24”x.080 $ 8.76 | S 16.00 | $ 8.17 | $ 7.80
69 36” x.080 S 19.72| S 25.00 | S 18.30|S  17.55
Apparent Low Bidder on Line Item
Note: Recommend awarding to Osburn all line items
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