Mail - bbray@nassaucountyfl.com Page 1 of 6

RE: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)

Evans, Kimberly <Kimberly.Evans@dot.state.fl.us>

Tue 11/14/2017 11:11 AM

To:Becky Bray <bbray@nassaucountyfl.com>;

CcCerlanek, William <William.Cerlanek@dot.state. fl.us>;

6 attachments (19 MB)

Addendum No. 1 (NC17-027).doc; Addendum No 2 (NC17-027).pdf; Addendum No 3 (NC17-027).pdf; NC17-012 ITB.pdf; Bid
Tabulation (NC17-027).pdf; NC17-027 Florida Infrastructure.pdf;

Hi Becky,

Thanks for providing additional information concerning the advertisement addendum waiving
pre-qualification of the contractor based on the threshold under $250,000 per 337.14.

In addition, since your lowest bidder withdrew and is hon-responsive, you may proceed with
your second bidder, Florida Infrastructure for the shoulder repair in the amount of $245,600.00.

Please consider this email as your Concurrence in Award.

Kim Evans

District Local Programs Administrator

Program Management — Local Programs Section — MS 2014
1109 South Marion Avenue

Lake City, Florida 32025

Phone: 386-961-7402
mailto:kimberly.evans@dot.state.fl.us

“Be the change you want to see”

From: Becky Bray [mailto:bbray@nassaucountyfl.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 1, 2017 12:31 PM

To: Evans, Kimberly <Kimberly.Evans@dot.state.fl.us>
Subject: Fw: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)

Kim,
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The County waved the pre-qualification requirement.

Thank you,

Becky Hiers-Bray, P.E.

Nassau County Road & Bridge Director
37356 Pea Farm Road

Hilliard, FL 32046

(904) 530-6175 Phone

(904) 845-3613 Fax
bbray@nassaucountyfl.com
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From: Angela Gregory

Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2017 9:57 AM

To: Becky Bray

Cc: Charlotte Young

Subject: RE: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)

Becky,

Addendum No. 2 under the question and answers we stated that the County will waive the FDOT pre-qualifications. It was not

written in the ITB but mentioned in the pre-bid meeting and then quickly challenged by a vendor.

Thanks,
Angela Gregory
Nassau County Procurement Manager

904-530-6040

From: Becky Bray

Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2017 9:32 AM

To: Angela Gregory <agregory@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Charlotte Young <cyoung@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: Re: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)
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| have additional information to share when you have time. Please just let me know if the bid required the contractor to be FDOT
pre-qualified.

Becky Bray

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 26, 2017, at 8:23 AM, Angela Gregory <agregory@nassaucountyfl.com> wrote:

Becky,

Because the CEl services bring the total budget of the project over $250,000. | would suggest we send this back
out for bids. This time we make sure we do not waiver on the FDOT pre-qualification.

Thanks,
Angela Gregory
Nassau County Procurement Manager

904-530-6040

From: Becky Bray

Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2017 11:32 AM

To: Angela Gregory <agregory@nassaucountyfl.com>
Subject: FW: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3}

FYl

Becky Hiers-Bray, P.E.

Nassau County Road & Bridge Director
37356 Pea Farm Road

Hilliard, FL 32046
(904) 530-6175 Phone

(904) 845-3613 Fax

bbray@nassaucountyfl.com
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From: Evans, Kimberly [mailto;Kimberly.Evans@dot state.fl.us]
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2017 1.42 PM

To: Becky Bray <bbray@nassaucountyfl.com>

Cc: Cerlanek, William <William.Cerlanek@dot.state fl.us>
Subject: RE: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)

Becky,
This is to follow up with our telephone discussion.

Yes, it is absolutely OK to go with your second choice since the bidder withdrew and is non-responsive. | have
another question. Does Florida Infrastructure go by another name?

I've checked and Florida Infrastructure is not showing up on the FDOT Pre-qualification list. Will the total cost of
work be under $2500,0007 If so, we can waive the pre-qualification per FS 337.14

If the projects total cost (design, construction, CEl) is under $250,0000 then the Agency may waive the FDOT pre-
qualification per 337.14

<image001,jpg>
I've also found out that you can run a 14 day ad however 21 days is preferred.

Just let me know what you come up with.

Kim Evans

District Local Programs Administrator
Program Management — Local Programs Section — MS 2014

1109 South Marion Avenue

https://outlook.office.com/owa/?path=/mail/search 11/21/2017



Mail - bbray@nassaucountyfl.com Page 5 of 6

Lake City, Florida 32025

Phone: 386-961-7402

mailto:kimberly.evans@dot.state.fl.us

“Be the change you want to see”

From: Becky Bray [mailto:bbray@nassaucountyfl.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 19, 2017 7:30 AM

To: Evans, Kimberly <Kimberly.Evans@dot state.fl.us>

Cc: Angela Gregory <agregory@nassaucountyfl.com>; Charlotte Young <cyoung@nassaucountyfl.com>; Scott
Herring <sherring@nassaucountyfl.com>; Shelley Caldwell <scaldwell@nassaucountyfl.com>; David Hearn
<dhearn@nassaucountyfl.com>; Darren Marsh <dmarsh@nassaucountyfl.com>; Jennifer Kirkland
<jkirkland@nassaucountyfl.com>

Subject: Middle Griffin Shoulder Repair Bids (Email 1/3)

Kim,

Attached are the bid tabulation and bid packages received for the Middle Griffin Road Shoulder
Repair project. The lowest bidder, JMD Global Developers has submitted at letter forfeiting their
bid. Therefore, the County would like to move forward with awarding the bid to the 2nd lowest
bidder, Florida Infrastructure, Inc.

Please let us know FDOT concurs with this recomméndation.

Due to the size of the bid packages submitted, | will be sending a total of 3 emails. Please let me
know if you do not receive all of the emails.

Thank you,

Becky Hiers-Bray, P.E.

Nassau County Road & Bridge Director
37356 Pea Farm Road

Hilliard, FL 32046
(904) 530-6175 Phone
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(904) 845-3613 Fax

bbray@nassaucountyfl.com

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are pubiic records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this
office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail
address released in response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail
to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail
address released in response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail
to this entity. Instead, please contact this office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released
in response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please
contact this office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact this
office by phone or in writing.

Under Florida law, e-mail addresses are public records. If you do not want your e-mail address released in
response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to this entity. Instead, please contact

this office by phone or in writing.
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